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RE: Diesel Fuel, Bio-Diesel B-5 Blend & Unleaded Gasoline RFB 6152022

Below are questions/answers for the above referenced RFB. All other terms and conditions remain the same.

1. When does the District plan on awarding this contract?
By the end of June 2022

2. Who is the current incumbent?
Pro Petroleum

3. May | please get a bid tabulation from the last award of this contract?
See Attachment

4. Does the District ever get split loads {i.e., gasoline and diesel on the same truck for delivery on the same day?
Yes

5. What is the average delivery size for diesel?
5,000-7,000 Gallons

6. What is the average delivery size for unleaded gasoline?
5,000-7,000 Gallons

7. s the District exempt from any taxes?
No

8. What is the Districts payment terms?
Net 30

9. Can |l please get a copy of the most recent diesel fuel invoice and supporting bill of lading?
Not available

Amphitheater High « Canyon del Oro High * Ironwood Ridge High
Amphitheater Middle School » Coronado K-8 School « Cross Middle School » La Cima Middle School + Wilson K-8 School
Copper Creek Elementary » Donaldson Elementary » Harelson Elementary « Holaway Elementary « Innovation Academy * Keeling Elementary
Mesa Verde Elementary « Nash Elementary « Painted Sky Elementary ¢ Prince Elementary » Rio Vista Elementary » Walker Elementary « Rillito Center « Amphi
Academy Online

Amphitheater Unified School District does not discriminate on the basis of race, color, religion/religious beliefs, gender, sex, age, national origin, sexual orientation, creed, citizenship
status, marital status, political beliefs/affiliation, disability, home language, family, social or cultural background in its programs or activities and provides equal access to the Boy
Scouts and other designated youth groups. Inquiries regarding the District’s non-discrimination policies are handled at 701 W. Wetmore Road, Tucson, Arizona 85705 by David

Rucker, Equity & Safety Compliance Officer
and Title IX Coordinator, (520) 696-5164, drucker@amphi.com, or Kristin McGraw, Executive Director of Student Services, (520) 696-5230, kinceraw@ampli.com.
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10. May | please get a copy of the most recent fuel invoice and supporting bill of lading?
Not Available

11. Who is your current vendor?
Pro Petroleum

12. Please provide copies of invoices and bill of landings for each product?
Not Available

13. Can vendors offer a diesel with up to 5% bio in lieu of B5 diesel?
Yes

14. Please provide a copy of a certificate of analysis covering the bic component.
Not available

15. What is your average delivery size for each product?
5,000-7,000 Gallons

16. Petroleum Trader Corporations open records request. Upon receipt, please advise when we may review the
requested documents.
Contract recordsrequest@amphi.com for status of the submitted records request.

END OF AMENDMENT ONE RFB 6152022
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AMPHITHEATER GOVERNING BOARD AGENDA ITEM
Public Sehools AMPHITHEATER UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 10

DATE OF MEETING: June 6, 2017

TITLE: Award of Contract for Diesel Fuel Bio Diesel B-5 Blend and Unleaded Gasoline
Based Upon Responses to Request for Bid (RFB) 05-23-2017

BACKGROUND:

Request for Bid (RFB) 05-23-2017 was e-mailed to eleven vendors, published on the District’s website, and a
notice of the RFB was issued on the ProcureAZ website. Five vendors responded with responsive bids. The
results are below:

Mansfield Oil
Arizona Company of | Petroleum Supreme
Petroleum Gainesville Traders Pro 0Oil

Item Description Products Inc. Corporation | Petroleum | Company
B-5 Diesel Phoenix OPIS 1.6021 1.5889 1.5872 1.5872 1.5872
B-5 Diesel Tucson OPIS No Bid 1.8488 No Bid No Bid No Bid
B-5 Diesel Phoenix Differential +0.05 +0.0343 +0.0412 -0.0064 +0.0225
B-5 Diesel Tucson Differential No Bid -0.0383 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Unleaded Phoenix OPIS 1.7787 1.7649 1.7787 1.7787 1.7787
Unleaded Tucson OPIS No Bid 1.8513 1.8607 1.8607 1.8607
Unleaded Phoenix Differential +0.04 +0.0534 +0.0334 +0.0025 +0.025
Unleaded Tucson Differential No Bid -0.0157 -0.0525 -0.0365 +0.025

RECOMMENDATION:

It is the recommendation of the Administration that the Governing Board award a contract to Pro Petroleum
based on their bid response to RFB 05-23-2017 for the B-5 Diesel Phoenix OPIS (Oil Price Information
Service) pricing and the Unleaded Phoenix OPIS pricing. This contract will begin on July 1, 2017 and expire
on 6/30/18 with the option to renew for four additional fiscal years.

INITIATED BY:
Scott Little, Chief Financial Officer Date: May 30,2017

Patrick Nelson, Superintendent







